
A Downtown DC Hotel With Quiet Confidence



A Hideaway Hotspot for Those in the Know 
It’s Time to Make Your Move

Kimpton Mason & Rook Hotel is the District’s most stylish hotel. 
Guests are lured in for the prime location just off  the bustling 14th 
Street Corridor, and dwell in the stylish living room.  Radiator, the 
on-site restaurant offers a hip hangout for craft cocktails and globally 
inspired bites. Self-assured yet reflective, the space is richly textured 
but never showy. Among the residential styling, you’ll discover 
something or someone new each time you visit—an artifact, a cocktail,  
a new culinary treasure. Kimpton Mason & Rook Hotel is where 
experiences are met with genuine craft and warm, personal service.

Attending events at Kimpton Mason & Rook Hotel provides an 
intimacy rarely found in other downtown DC hotels. From weddings 
or larger events in The Exchange, to intimate board meetings in one 
of  our three smaller rooms, Marshall, Fischer and Byrne, you‘ll find 
that Kimpton Mason & Rook Hotel offers just what you need. To keep 
guests playing for keeps, Radiator, the on-site restaurant handles all 
catering and private dining, enhancing any affair with curated menu 
options and mixology adventures.

• Prime location on a tree-lined street

• Steps from the 14th Street corridor, DC’s premier location for 
nightlife, restaurants, shopping

• Oversized, stylized guest rooms with large work space

• Marble baths with large walk-in showers and shoulder to shoulder 
shower heads

• One-bedroom Premium Spa Suites with full-immersion  
deep-soaking tubs

• 65-inch plasma televisions in all guest rooms and suites

• 7,200+ square feet of  richly appointed meeting & event space

• On-site culinary driven cocktail bar, Radiator

• Private Dining for up to 22 people; community table for 8

• Seasonal Rooftop Bar

• Pool access seasonally for hotel guests

• 24-hour valet parking

• Full-service fitness center

• Complimentary wireless Internet for Kimpton Karma members

• PUBLIC bikes

• Gaiam yoga mats in every room

Kimpton Mason & Rook Hotel

1430 Rhode Island Ave NW, Washington, DC 20005
Reservations: 800-546-7866 | Hotel Direct: 202-742-3100
sales@masonandrookhotel.com | masonandrookhotel.com 
#MasonAndRook
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